
 
 



How to Track Attendance at Organizational Events 

 

If at any time you are having difficulties with the following, feel free to stop by the Campus Life 
front desk for assistance. Or you may call 405-744-5486 or you may reach us at 
campuslife@okstate.edu.   

 

In order to track attendance at an event, you will need to check out an ID card reader. 
These can be found in 211 Student Union (the Campus Life Office) at the front desk.  

 

Step One: Log in to CampusLink using your OKEY username and password. If you are having 
trouble logging in, please contact OSU IT. Upon login, you should be directed to the home page 
for CampusLink.  

 

  

 

 

 

 

 



 

Step Two: From this screen, you will need to find the organization you are looking to update 
click on it. In the event that you are not a member of the organization on CampusLink, you will 
need to find your organization through the Organizations tab and request to be added.  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Step Three: After clicking on the organization name, you will be directed to your organization’s 
home page. From this screen, you will need to click the Manage Organization button at the top 
right corner of the page.  

 

 

 

 

 



Step Four: After clicking on Manage Organization, you will be redirected to the “Action 
Center.” In order to access the Events section, you will click on the menu icon to the left of your 
Organization’s name. 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 

Step Five: From the Action Center, you will be directed to the Manage Events section of your 
CampusLink page. In order to set-up attendance tracking, click on the name of the event.  

 

 

 



 

 

Step Six: Once you have been directed to the second Manage Event page that is specific to your 
event, click on the Track Attendance button.  

 

 



 

Step Seven: On this page you will see an area that says “Swipe Access Code” and the URL to 
the “Swipe Page” immediately next to it. Click on the box directly to the right of the code, which 
will copy the access code to your clipboard.  

 

 



 

Step Eight: Next, click on the “Swipe Page” URL. You will be prompted to enter in the “Swipe 
Access Code” which you should be able to right click and paste into the text box. Once the code 
has been entered, click on Submit. 

 

 



Step Nine: Once this has been done, you should be given an empty text box with the words, 
“Ready to Swipe” directly underneath it. Plug the card swipe device into your computer or tablet 
and wait for the green light to stop flashing. Once this is done, you can begin tracking attendance 
through swiping an individual’s Student ID card.  

 

Tip: You do not need to click on the Submit button after each swipe. This is only necessary 
if you manually enter someone’s ID.  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Step Ten: Once you have swiped in all attendees, exit out of the Swipe page and refresh the 
Track Attendance page. Once the page has reloaded, you will be able to see all individuals who 
attended the event and swiped in with the card reader. If you would like to export this 
information in the form of an excel file, you may do so by clicking the red Export button in the 
top right hand of the screen.  

 

  


